PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION

BID 08-034K
TOILET REBATE PROGRAM, ANNUAL AWARD
3/3/2008
NIAGARA
COASTAL LANDFILL DEMETRI'S CONSERVATION VIEWTECH
COAST TO COAST OF = DISPOSAL OF FL, SOLUTIONS, PORT CORP, CEDAR PAW MATERIALS INC, FINANCIAL
TAMPA, TAMPA, FL HUDSON, FL RICHEY, FL KNOLLS, NJ HUDSON, FL SERVICES, TAMPA, FL
A1l NO BID $30/ $ 15,000 $18 / $9,000 $36.50 / $18,250 NO BID $39 / $19,500
A.2A NO BID $30 / $15,000 $18 / $9,000 $36.50 / $9,125 NO BID $39 / $9,750
A. 2B NO BID $10 / $5,000 $18 / $9,000 $22.50 / $5,625 NO BID $23 / $5,750
A 3 NO BID $30 / $15,000 $18 / $9,000 $36.50 / $18,250 NO BID $39 / $19,500
A.4A NO BID $30 / $15,000 $18 7/ $9,000 $36.50 / $9.125 NO BID $39 7/ $9,750
A. 4B NO BID $10 / $5,000 $18 / $9,000 $22.50 / $5.625 NO BID $23 / $5,750
A.5 NO BID $2,500.00 $4,000.00 $16,850.00 NO BID $2,000.00
B. 6 $17,500.00 $10,900.00 $9,000.00 $5,000.00 $37,500.00 $0.00
TOTAL $17,500.00 $83,400.00 $67,000.00 $72,650.00 $37,500.00 $72,000.00 (+)
START
WORK 10 DAY 45 DAYS 1 DAY 14 DAYS 5 DAYS 10 DAYS
COMPLETE
WORK 10 DAYS AS SPECIFIED 3 DAYS 365 DAYS 365 DAYS 30 DAYS




